

18-033 NEW VEHICLES				
OPENS: 12/19/18 - 3PM				
COMPANY:	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Grapevine DCT, LLC	Jim Bass Ford, Inc	
ADDRESS:	PO Box 27 Caldwell, TX 77836	2601 William Tate Grapevine, TX 76051	4032 Houston Harte Expy San Angelo, TX 76901	
CONTACT NAME:	Averyt Knapp	Dennis Thomas	Butch Strain	
PHONE #:	979.567.6116	817.410.7541	325.949.4621 x384	
FAX #:	979.567.0853		325.947.7591	
EMAIL:	aknapp@caldwellcountry.com	dthomas@grapevinedcj.com	butch.strain@bassbunch.com	
WEB ADDRESS:	www.caldwellcountry.com	www.grapevine.com	www.bassbunch.com	
New 2019 1/2 Ton, truck, single cab, long bed, school bus yellow	\$22,984.00	\$20,256.00	\$22,853.00	
MAKE/MODEL:	Chevrolet	Ram	Ford	
New 2019 3/4 Ton, truck, single cab, cab & chassis only School bus yellow	no bid	no bid	\$25,054.00	
MAKE/MODEL:			Ford	
New 2019 1 Ton cab & 1/2, cab & chassis only School bus yellow				
A. 6.2L EFI V8				
MAKE/MODEL:	no bid	no bid	29320.00 / Ford	
B. 6.2L Diesel				
MAKE/MODEL:	no bid	no bid	37104.00 / Ford	
New 2019 1/2 ton 8 passenger suburban type vehicle, White	\$39,725.00	no bid	\$42,215.00	
MAKE/MODEL:	Chevrolet			
Total Cost units:				
Estimated delivery time for New Vehicles:	90-120 days	180-210	Truck w/yellow paint 100-150 days; SUV 115-125 days	
Length of time proposal is firm:	90 days	Thru 05/01/2019	SUV - 7 months Trucks - 8 months	
Deviations:		buy board quote	Item #1 - 3.5 L V6 has been replaced by 3.3L V6	
Total Score	75.70	79.30	89.30	